

CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK BID SUMMARY

Bid Number: 16-3381

Date: April 14, 2016 @ 10:00 am

OPENED BY: Amy Smith

SUMMARY BY: Crystal Willis

TRANSFORMERS FOR THE NLRED	WESCO	WESCO	IRBY	BORDER STATES	TECHLINE
PRESENT AT BID OPENING	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No
5% Bid Bond	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No
100% Performance Bond	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No
150KVA 120/208V Each @ \$	No Bid	7277.32	6296.00	7542.00	9239.00
500KVA 277/480V Each @ \$	No Bid	11844.33	9398.00	10063.00	12,199.00
750KVA 277/480V Each @ \$	No Bid	13264.95	12605.00	12075.00	17079.00
167KVA 120/240V Each @ \$	3425.03	3768.05	4050.00	3446.00	4089.00
167KVA 240/480V Each @ \$	3383.17	3797.94	3920.00	3195.00	3959.00
167KVA 277/480V Each @ \$	3089.57	3603.09	3190.00	2971.00	3219.00
Manufacturer	Cooper	Howard Industries	CG Power Central Maloney	GE	Central Maloney
Delivery		6-8 Wks 8-10 Wks	13-15 Wks 10 Wks	13-15 Wks 9-11 Wks	12 Wks

CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK BID SUMMARY

Bid Number: 16-3381

Date: April 14, 2016 @ 10:00 am

OPENED BY: Amy Smith

SUMMARY BY: Crystal Willis

TRANSFORMERS FOR THE NLRED	TECHLINE	TECHLINE	ANIXER	ANIXER	ANIXER	
PRESENT AT BID OPENING	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	
5% Bid Bond	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	
100% Performance Bond	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	Yes No	
150KVA 120/208V Each @ \$	6079.00	7239.00	9190.00	6358.00		
500KVA 277/480V Each @ \$	9429.00	11779.00	12144.00	9491.00		
750KVA 277/480V Each @ \$	12049.00	13189.00	16989.00	12697.00		
167KVA 120/240V Each @ \$	3469.00	3739.00	4069.00	No Bid		
167KVA 240/480V Each @ \$	3249.00	3769.00	3939.00	No Bid		
167KVA 277/480V Each @ \$	3019.00	3579.00	3206.00	No Bid		
Manufacturer	ABB/Power Partners	Howard Industries	Central Maloney	CG Power		
Delivery	6-8 Wks	12-14 Wks	12 Wks 10 Wks	13-15 Wks		